

2019 Westborough ASP Silent Action

	Donor Name	2019 Donation	Winner's Bid Number	Winning Bid	
Dining	Arturo's Ristorante	\$50 Gift Card	70	\$ 55.00	
	Bertucci's Restaurant, Westborough	\$25 Gift Certificate	54	\$ 25.00	
	British Beer Company, Westford	\$25 Gift Card	1	\$ 20.00	
	Buffalo Wild Wings	BWW Bucket of Sauces and more + \$15 Gift Certificate	12	\$ 45.00	
	Burtons Grill & Bar of Shrewsbury	\$50 Gift Card	19	\$ 50.00	
	Bushel-N-Peck Deli	\$25 Gift Card	30	\$ 25.00	
	Cheng Du Restaurant	\$25 Gift Certificate	76	\$ 24.00	
	Chipotle Grill, Corporate	"Dinner for 4" vouchers	37	\$ 41.00	
	Christina's Café	\$20 Gift Certificate	17	\$ 18.00	
	Civic Kitchen & Drink	\$25 Gift Certificate	55	\$ 30.00	
	El Basha Bar & Bistro	\$20 Gift Card	47	\$ 20.00	
	Firefly's BBQ	\$25 Gift Certificate	12	\$ 32.00	
	Hot Table	\$20 gift cards	70	\$ 25.00	
	Hunters Grille & Tap at The Grafton Inn	\$40 Gift Certificate	70	\$ 45.00	
	JP's Restaurant Pub	\$40 Gift Certificate	54	\$ 30.00	
	LongHorn Steakhouse	\$25 Gift Card	1	\$ 25.00	
	Longfellow's Wayside Inn	Dinner For Two	63	\$ 100.00	
	Mohegan Sun	Dinner for 4 at Season's Buffet	3	\$ 75.00	
	Not Your Average Joe's, Westborough	\$50 Gift Card	28	\$ 60.00	
	Owen O'Leary's	\$25 Gift Certificate	28	\$ 25.00	
	Panera Bread Westborough	\$25 Gift Certificate	59	\$ 25.00	
	Rail Trail Flatbread Co.	\$33 Gift Card	70	\$ 50.00	
	Special Teas Teashop	\$25 Gift Certificate	18	\$ 25.00	
	Tavern in the Square Restaurant, Northboro	\$50 Gift Card	28	\$ 60.00	
	Ted's Montana Grill Restaurant	\$20 Off Card	54	\$ 20.00	
	The Bistro Bakery & Café	\$20 Gift Certificate	55	\$ 30.00	
	The Cheesecake Factory	\$50 Gift Card	46	\$ 50.00	
	The Melting Pot	Two \$25 Dip Certificates	12	\$ 50.00	
	The Red Heat Tavern	\$20 Gift Card	24	\$ 20.00	
	The Sole Proprietor 111 Chophouse Via	\$25 Gift Card	27	\$ 26.00	
Tomasso Trattoria	\$100 Gift Card	75	\$ 80.00		
Uno Pizzeria & Grill	\$50 Gift Certificate	63	\$ 50.00		
Home	AAA Marborough	One Year Membership AAA Northeast	22	\$ 27.00	
	Angel Art Photography	\$100 Gift Certificate	23	\$ 50.00	
	Art & Frame Emporium	Tracer Projector Jr.	No Bid	\$ -	
	Barnes & Noble, Shoppes at Blackstone Valley	Gel Ink CROSS Pen Blue	27	\$ 25.00	
	Barnes & Noble, Shoppes at Blackstone Valley	Gel Ink CROSS Pen Black	24	\$ 20.00	
	Barnes & Noble, Shoppes at Blackstone Valley	Gel Ink CROSS Pen Silver	27	\$ 25.00	
	Bed Bath & Beyond	\$20 Gift Card	63	\$ 20.00	
	Car Wash and Detailing of Westborough	3-Months Unlimited Soft Touch Car Washes	54	\$ 50.00	
	Cheryl Allen, CLAY ACCENTS	Hand-made Pottery Oil Dipping Set	64	\$ 25.00	
	Classique Consignment	\$25 Gift Certificate	1	\$ 22.00	
	Dave Mathewson Landscaping	Free lawn cut & trim	17	\$ 60.00	
	Dick's Woodworking - Dick Cacciapouti	Serving Tray handcrafted from Maple, Cherry, Purpleheart & American Walnut	64	\$ 75.00	
	Faris Farm Flowers	\$50 Gift Certificate	46	\$ 50.00	
	J Hilburn	\$100 Voucher for Custom Tailored Men's Clothing	11	\$ 75.00	
	Joyce Avery	3 Months of Piano Lessons	23	\$ 25.00	
	Karen Amlaw Music	One month of Kids on Keys Lessons	No Bid	\$ -	
	Landry's Bicycles	\$25 Gift Card	45	\$ 25.00	
	Littleton Lumber	Hitachi 2" Brad Nailer	27	\$ 150.00	
	Lowe's Home Improvement, Lowell	DeWalt 20v Compact Drill/Driver Kit	1	\$ 120.00	
	MetalDetector.com	\$50 Gift Certificates	56	\$ 30.00	
	Mugford's Flower Shoppe	\$50 Gift Card	53	\$ 35.00	
	Stonefire Outdoor Living	\$100 Gift Certificate	No Bid	\$ -	
	The Sleigh Maker Inn	Sleigh Maker Inn Stoneware Mug & Handmade Soaps	46	\$ 10.00	
	Town Fair Tires	Gift Certificate for Alignment	No Bid	\$ -	
	Westborough Ace Hardware	\$20 Gift Certificate	76	\$ 22.00	
	Wright Family	"Peace" Glass Print	31	\$ 100.00	
	Wright Family	Set of 3 Ceramic Ornaments; Hummingbird, Seagull & Bluebird	No Bid	\$ 50.00	
	Xenos Family	PlasmaCar Scooter	11	\$ 35.00	
	Jewels	Designer Jewelers	\$50 Gift Card	56	\$ 45.00
		Hannoush Jewelers	Petra Azar Silver and Yellow Sapphire Ribbon of Hope Pendant	No Bid	\$ -
Out of Hand! Stained and Fused Glass		"I love you to the moon & back" Silver Pendant	17	\$ 40.00	
Out of Hand! Stained and Fused Glass		Pink Starburst with Silver Chain	32	\$ 15.00	

Please Bid Generously

2019 Westborough ASP Silent Action

	Donor Name	2019 Donation	Winner's Bid Number	Winning Bid	
Gym	Boroughs Family Branch YMCA	3-Month Membership	73	\$ 130.00	
	CrossFit Prototype	One month unlimited CrossFit + 4 virtuosity sessions	26	\$ 60.00	
	CrossFit Prototype	Integrated Martial Arts	No Bid	\$ -	
	EXCEED Sports Performance & Fitness, LLC	One-month Half Week Membership	11	\$ 125.00	
	Fitness Together	Personal Training "Jump Start"	No Bid	\$ -	
	Wayside Racquet & Swim Club	Day at the Club fo Four (4) for July 4th	No Bid	\$ -	
	Westboro Tennis & Swim Club	3-month Adult Fitness Membership	23	\$ 60.00	
Entertainment	5 Wits	Four VIP Passes	33	\$ 50.00	
	Berlin Orchards	\$25 Gift Certs	50	\$ 25.00	
	Berlin Orchards	\$25 Gift Certs	24	\$ 20.00	
	Board & Brush	A Free Workshop	2	\$ 50.00	
	Boston Duck Tours	Two Complimentary Passes	4	\$ 50.00	
	Boston Harbor Cruises	Two Adults - Sunset Cocktail Cruise	75	\$ 75.00	
	Boston Tea Party Museum	4 VIP Museum Passes	23	\$ 60.00	
	Bowlero AMF Guest Service	Fun pack for 4 - 2 hours + shoes	66	\$ 65.00	
	Central Rock Gym - Worcester	Two All Day Free Climbing Pass	2	\$ 35.00	
	Echo Lake Campground, O'Neil Family	Two Nights at Echo Lake Campground, Pascoag, Rhode Island & 2 Tee Shirts	26	\$ 75.00	
	EcoTarium	One-Day Family Pass	27	\$ 40.00	
	Foxwood Resort Casino	Tickets (2) to Michael McDonald & Chaka Khan Sunday June 23th, 7:30pm	37	\$ 50.00	
	Freedom Trail Foundation	Family Tickets (4) for "Walk into History" Public Tour	8	\$ 22.00	
	Great Wolf Lodge	Waterpark Passes (5)	58	\$ 125.00	
	Hanover Theatre	Tickets (2) for Tap Dogs, Saturday April 13th, 8PM	71	\$ 110.00	
	Hy-Line Cruises - Ferry	Round Trip for 2 on High-Speed Martha's Vineyard - Hyannis Ferry	50	\$ 65.00	
	ICA - The Institute of Contemporary Art	Two Museum Passes	59	\$ 20.00	
	Improv Asylum at Laugh Boston	Vouchers good for 4 tickets	27	\$ 80.00	
	Lookout Farm	Four Day Passes	6	\$ 36.00	
	New England Aquarium	Two Aquarium Passes	33	\$ 30.00	
	Old Sturbridge Village	Family Admission Pass Voucher	67	\$ 42.00	
	PYOP Studio (Paint Your Own Pottery)	\$25 Studio Certificate	63	\$ 20.00	
	Sawyer's Bowladrome	\$25 Gift Certificate	3	\$ 20.00	
	Skywalk Boston/Top of the Hub	4 Tickets to Skywalk Observatory	No Bid	\$ -	
	Sky Zone Indoor Trampoline Park	(4) 1 hour weekday jump passes	27	\$ 45.00	
	Southwick's Zoo	General Admission Pass for Two	27	\$ 30.00	
	Strange Brew	Wine Making Class for 2 & \$15 Gift Certificate	33	\$ 45.00	
	Strange Brew	Beer Making Class for 2 & Refillable Growler	No Bid	\$ -	
	Swan Boats	Voucher for group up to 10 people	50	\$ 25.00	
	Taylor Family	Weekend At The Cape - off season	14	\$ 350.00	
	The Butterfly Place	\$35 Gift Certificate	50	\$ 20.00	
	The Discovery Museums	Free admission for up to 4 people	50	\$ 40.00	
	The Sports Museum, TD Garden	Group Pass to The Sports Museum for 10 people	23	\$ 75.00	
	The Whiz Store	\$25 Gift Certificate	73	\$ 20.00	
	Trombetta's Farm	Family 4 Pack of Mini Golf	1	\$ 20.00	
	Trombetta's Farm	Family 4 Pack of Mini Golf	76	\$ 18.00	
	Uhlman's Farm Ice Cream	Pink Uhlman's T-shirt size small, squishy "stress cow," and 2-\$5 coins	72	\$ 25.00	
	Willard House & Clock Museum	Family Membership + Tour with Curator	No Bid	\$ -	
	X1 Boston	A Complete Arrive & Drive Race for Two	27	\$ 60.00	
	XtremeCraze - Westboro (Laser Craze)	Voucher for 5 people - Laser Tag or Adrenaline Zone	58	\$ 40.00	
	Health & Beauty	Dellaria Hair Salon, Marlboro Apex	\$50 Gift Card for Marlboro Apex Salon	32	\$ 25.00
		KaLis Day Spa	\$60 Gift Certificate	57	\$ 50.00
King's Corner Barbershop		\$55 Gift Card	46	\$ 40.00	
Lindsay Taylor SPAtique		Certificate for 60 Minute Massage	48	\$ 55.00	
PR Running		\$35 Gift Certificate	47	\$ 35.00	
Profilo Day Spa		Sea Salt Pedicure	28	\$ 50.00	
Release Well Being Center		One-Month Breathe and Bliss Membership	46	\$ 185.00	
Release Well Being Center		Mini "Day of Release" w/60 minute Facial	39	\$ 70.00	
Release Well Being Center		Signature DUO Massage Package	1	\$ 175.00	
Salon77		\$100 Gift Certificate for Cut/Color	1	\$ 45.00	
South County Physical Therapy		Injury Prevention Assessment For Golfer & Runners	No Bid	\$ -	
South County Physical Therapy		Injury Prevention Assessment For Golfer & Runners	No Bid	\$ -	
Spavia		Gift Certificate for Massage or Facial	24	\$ 40.00	
Yoga with Carol		Certificate for 1 Yoga Therapy Session	9	\$ 40.00	

Please Bid Generously

2019 Westborough ASP Silent Action

	Donor Name	2019 Donation	Winner's Bid Number	Winning Bid
Markets & Café	Cork & Grain	\$20 Gift Card	23	\$ 25.00
	Costco	\$25 Gift Card	76	\$ 10.00
	DCU, Westborough Branch	\$50 Visa Cards	46	\$ 50.00
	DCU, Westborough Branch	\$50 Visa Cards	37	\$ 50.00
	Heberts Candy Mansion	Large Hebert's Chocolate Gift Basket	12	\$ 40.00
	Lalajava	\$20 Lala Loot	20	\$ 18.00
	Littleton Liquors	Bottle of Red, Bottle of White	17	\$ 16.00
	Roche Brothers	\$100 Gift Card	55	\$ 110.00
	Simple Enough Natural Foods	\$25 Gift Certificate	18	\$ 25.00
	Target Stores	\$50 Gift Card	71	\$ 60.00
	Wegmans	\$100 Gift Card	71	\$ 105.00
Golf	Fore! Golf Entertainment	\$25 Gift Cards	13	\$ 10.00
	Fore! Golf Entertainment	\$25 Gift Cards	46	\$ 10.00
	Highfields Golf & Country Club	Golf Foursome	3	\$ 150.00
	Hopkinton Country Club	Golf Foursome w/ Carts	16	\$ 200.00
	Shaker Hills Country Club, Harvard	Golf Foursome w/ Carts	68	\$ 175.00
	The Haven Country Club	Golf Foursome w/ Carts	69	\$ 210.00
	Westborough Country Club & Jack Negoshian,	Golf Foursome w/ Carts (18 Holes)	67	\$ 125.00
Ski	Boston Ski & Tennis	One Seasonal Ski Lease	38	\$ 150.00
	Nashoba Valley Ski Area	2 Anytime Lift Tickets	No Bid	\$ -
	Pat's Peak, Henniker, NH	2 Lift Tickets	No Bid	\$ -
	The Ski Barn	Ski or Snow Board Tune-up	27	\$ 30.00
Sports	Wachusett Mountain Ski Area	2 Community Spirit Tickets: Limited Lift Tickets Valid For Two Seasons	27	\$ 71.00
	Anjoorian Family	Pre-season Patriots (3) Tickets, Section 237, Row 10, Seats 14, 15, 16; Date TBD	7	\$ 120.00
	Bowditch & Dewey	4 Tickets to Railers vs. Monarchs Hockey, April 3, Sec 122, Row C, Seats 10-13	75	\$ 54.00
	DCU Center	Tickets (4) Worcester Pirates vs Carolina Cobras April 13 7PM	No Bid	\$ -
	Farmer Family - DELL	Family 4-packs of Revolution Soccer tickets	42	\$ 70.00
	Farmer Family - DELL	Family 4-packs of Revolution Soccer tickets	23	\$ 60.00
	Hogan Family	Bruins Ticket (2) vs Lightning	62	\$ 222.00
	Pawtucket Red Sox	4 General Admission Tickets, date tbd	1	\$ 18.00
	Providence Bruins	4 Tickets, Providence Bruins vs. Springfield Thunderbirds, Sun, April 14, 3:05PM	No Bid	\$ -
	Reinach Family	4 tickets - Red Sox vs. TBD	45	\$ 140.00
	Reynolds, Gerry	Pre-season Patriots (2) Tickets, Section 117, Row 20, Seats 14 and 15; Date TBD	63	\$ 110.00
	Screenprint /DOW	Red Sox Tickets (4) vs Tampa Saturday, June 8th 1PM	28	\$ 200.00
	Windham Mountain Resort	2 Vouchers to Mountain Bike Park	51	\$ 25.00
	Worcester Bravehearts	Four Grandstand Flex Vouchers - redeem for game of choice	40	\$ 20.00
Sports Mem	Boston Red Sox	Christian Vazquez Autographed Baseball	54	\$ 35.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Tom Brady/Julian Edelman	3	\$ 100.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Jayson Tatum (LeBron) 2017 Celtics 1st Round Draft Pick	71	\$ 100.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Sony Michel Touchdown	8	\$ 75.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Boston Strong	3	\$ 100.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Rob Gronkowski	63	\$ 85.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Tom Brady Super Bowl MVP, NFL MVP	No Bid	\$ -
	Yesterdays Legends	Starting 5, 2018 Boston Celtics	48	\$ 70.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Andrew Benintendi 2018 World Series Champion	36	\$ 125.00
	Yesterdays Legends	Boston Red Sox: Best Outfield in Baseball	35	\$ 150.00
White Mtns	Attitash & Wildcat Mountain Resorts	Two "Summer GA" Passes	16	\$ 49.00
	Conway Scenic Railroad	Conway Valley Train Guest Card 4 tickets (2 adults, 2 children)	17	\$ 40.00
	Cranmore Mountain Resort	Family Pack Mountain Adventure Park/Tubing Combo (4) Tickets	33	\$ 84.00
	Flatbread Company	One Lunch or Dinner for Four (4)	17	\$ 65.00
	Reitsma Family	3-Nights in the White Mountains, Lincoln NH Condo	49	\$ 440.00
	Sea Dog Brewing Co.	\$20 Gift Card	17	\$ 16.00
	Settlers Green and Settlers Crossing	\$50 Gift Card for Settlers Green	16	\$ 30.00
	Ziegler Family	White Mountain Victorian Manor, North Conway, 4-Night Rental	No Bid	\$ -

Please Bid Generously